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Visual Story Guide 

 

Saturday 10th December 2016  

 

 

 

The Relaxed Performance will 
start at 2.30pm 

 

 

 

and there is a second show at 
5pm 

 

 

Blue Elephant Theatre 
59a Bethwin RD (Entrance is 
on Thompson’s Ave)  
Camberwell  
London SE5 0XT 

 

 
Moon On A Stick is a Puppetry 
Theatre Company combining visual 
theatre, storytelling and puppetry to 
create work for audiences of all ages 
with a passion for producing  
accessible shows. 
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The performance is a story about 

 

 Jack Frost. 

 

 

 

The performance is happening at the 

Blue Elephant Theatre.  

 

 

 

 

 

 

The Blue Elephant Theatre is on        
Camberwell Road in South London       
SE5 0XT 

 Traveling by Bus 

12, 35, 36, 40, 42, 45, 68, 148,     
 171,176, 185, 436, 468 

 Nearest tube 

 Oval (15 minute walk*) 
 *data from TfL Journey Planner 
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Parking and Access 
 

  Blue Badge Holders is on Bethwin 
  Road, 35 meters from the main 
  theatre entrance. The route involves 
  crossing the road and there are no 
  adjacent dropped kerbs up to the  
  pavement level. 

The closest parking bays to the 
theatre are on Thompson Avenue 
next to cycle racks. These are not 
Blue Badge bays but are on the 
same pavement side as the theatre. 

 

 

This is the outside of the theatre 
when you arrive. 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

When you arrive, you will go in the 
main entrance. 

 

When you go in the building you 
will see this. 

 

 



 

4 

 

 

This is where you can wait until it’s 
show time! 

 

  This is also the entrance to the 
  performance space where the  
  show will happen.  

 

 

 

 

You can meet the actors that are in 
the play 15 minutes before the show 
will start! 

 

 

 

 

This is a picture of the actors and 
the puppet called Jack Frost.  

 

 

 

 

 

. 
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You will also meet another puppet 
that is in the show. 

Say hello to Laila 

There will also be shadow puppetry 
within the show. 

 

 

 

 

 

  The characters in the story are: 

  Jack Frost (Picture above) 

  Laila (Picture above) 

Villagers 

Bertram 

Snow Owl 

Young Laila 

 

(This is a picture of the actors and 
Villagers) 
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This is inside the theatre where the 
show will happen (with no people)  

 

When you go in there may be lots of 
people there too. You will have 
your own seat to sit on. 

 

 

 

 
 

 

The usher will be handing out hand 
made snow flakes 

The actor’s will also have these in 
the show.  

 

 

 

 

In the show, there will be lots and 
lots of bubbles. 
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  The actors will use these to blow   
  bubbles, they might come into   
  the audience for you to catch the   
  bubbles. 

 

 The lights will not go off in the  
 theatre but it may get a little darker.  
 
 (This picture is an example of what it 
 may be like) 

There will also be some bright lights. 
If it         is too bright you can wear 
tinted glasses or   cover your eyes.  

You can also move around to a  

           different seat where the lights may  
                   be less bright. 

 

.  

When the show starts, you will hear 
music and voices. If it is too loud 
you can cover your ears with your 
hands or use ear defenders.  
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Some people may shout out or clap 
their hands throughout the show. 
This is ok. They are showing that 
they enjoy the play. If you want to 
you can clap your hands too or 
choose to be quiet.  

 

 

 

 

 

If you want to leave the theatre at 
any point, there is a quiet space 
where you can go to relax and play.  

There may be other people in those 
rooms. 

 

 

There will be some sensory lights 
and toys in the space (as in the 
photo). 

When you are ready you can come 
back in. 
 

 

 

 

 

Some of the actors may ask you to join in at times. You can join in if you feel 

comfortable or just listen to other people joining in. This is called interacting 

with the characters. 



 

9 

 

 

When the performance has finished, the actors will come out on stage, stand 

up together. This is called a curtain call. Everyone will clap a lot so the actors 

know how much they enjoyed the show. Some people will also cheer and 

make a noise to show that they had a good time.  

 

This is where you will exit when 

the show has finished. 

 

 

 

 

 

Help? If you have questions or con-

cerns about access to the theatre, 
please call. 
 
 

020 7701 0100 to discuss your requirements. 
 
 
If you have any questions about the 
show, please email  
 

 

moononastickproductions@gmail.com  

    

    Thank you from  
    Moon on a Stick. 

 

http://www.moononastickproductions.com 

 

mailto:moononastickproductions@gmail.com

